
COOPERATIVE
PURCHASING

FURNITURE
BID #2023-109

DCMO BOCES INFORMATION
142 Whaupaunaucau Rd

Norwich, NY 13815
Contact: Ginger Bennett
Phone #: 607-335-1412

bennettg@dcmoboces.com

Bid Prices Expire on April 30, 2024



To: Participating Districts

From: Ginger Bennett

Date: May 1, 2023

Re: Cooperative Purchasing Furniture Bid Awards #2023-109

RESULTS & AWARDS:
The bid was opened on March 29, 2023 and resulted in eight bid submissions. One bid submission was rejected due to the
bidders agreement was unsigned. Two bid submissions were rejected due to bidding on Part B only and high shipping
minimums required for free shipping.

On April 5, 2023, the bid award recommendations were presented to the DCMO BOCES Board. The bid award
recommendations were approved and awarded by the Board.

Please see the attached “Furniture Bid Awards” in a PDF format. These are the results of the bid award
recommendations. Any district in the service may take advantage of this award, even if the district did not participate in
the initial requisitioning of items. The vendor contact sheet will give you additional information regarding the awarded
bidder, such as the address, phone number, contact person, etc.

Please make sure your PO’s include the Bid Number 2023-109

IMPORTANT BID INFORMATION:
Please note that according to our contract the awarded vendors must follow these terms:

● Must deliver and invoice within 35 days from the date the vendor confirms they received the purchase order. (If a
vendor fails to deliver in this time, please contact our office, as we may implement the Buy Against Clause)

● Pricing is firm until 4/30/23.
● Must provide the brand they specified on the bid throughout the bid contract.
● Must not substitute any item unless they have advance approval from the district.
● Cannot say an item is discontinued or no longer available, and offer you a higher priced item. – PLEASE

CONTACT US IMMEDIATELY – Substitutions must be at the bid price.
● Must not include shipping, handling or fuel surcharges on any order meeting minimum.
● You can combine orders for other items not on bid with any purchase order containing bid items to reach the

minimum ordering amount (if applicable).

DISCOUNTS:
The vendors who offer discounts off their website or catalog are listed below. If the item you need is not within this bid,

you can search for the item utilizing the discounts from the vendors to ensure that you are getting the best possible price.
Sometimes a 15% discount from one vendor is better than a 20% discount from another vendor but you must do your
research and also look at minimum order amounts. Please review the discount analysis for further information.



NO BID ITEMS/REJECTED ITEMS
If you see any price that shows as $0.00 on any reports or online this means the item in question did NOT RECEIVE A

BID. The item was either discontinued or not available from the vendors who provided a bid. The No Bid items may have
a suitable substitution within the bid awards.

PRODUCT QUALITY / VENDOR ISSUE RESOLUTION PROCESS:
If you have a Product Quality problem or Vendor Issue, please follow the process below:

1. Call the vendor contact person. Note the date and time you called about the issue. Make sure to have them give
you a time or date that the problem will be resolved. Make sure you get the person’s name and their phone
number.

2. If the problem is not resolved or the person you spoke to is not responsive to correcting the problem, please email
us the information below:

a. Details of the problem
b. The company you having an issue with
c. The PO Number and/or Invoice number
d. Your customer number
e. The person’s name at the company you spoke to about the issue and their phone #
f. Variance form

Once we have the information we will work with the vendor and copy you on the email. If you need to speak with us for
any reason, you can email us at cooppur@dcmoboces.com. Feel free to call or email us with your issues or concerns. We
will try our best to get it sorted!

READING THE PDF AWARDS:
To search the PDF, there is a “find” box in the tool bar or use CTL & F on your keyboard. A search bar will appear and

from there you can type in any keyword to find the items you are looking for.

mailto:cooppur@dcmoboces.com


Vendor Contact Information
Vendor Contact Phone & Fax Notes/Ref
Hummel's Lisa Urtz P: 315-574-8385  
25 Canal St Lisa@hummelsop.com F: 315-866-5360 No Discounts 

Mohawk, NY 13407 www.hummelsop.com   

Lakeshore Learning Penny Stone or Order Dept. P: 800-778-4456 Reference "Per Bid #2023-109"

2695 E. Dominguez Street
orderdept@lakeshorelearning.co

m F: 800-537-5403 7.5% off catalog & website price

Carson, CA 90895 www.lakeshorelearning.com  
Not applicable to sale items.

School Specialty Customer Care P: 1-888-388-3224
Reference #Q-300576

14% off catalog list price on website
100 Paragon Parkway orders@schoolspecialty.com F: 1-888-388-6344 $99 min order
Mansfield, OH 44903 www.schoolspecialty.com   
Syracuse Office
Environments Connor Treacy P: 315-476-9091  

375 Erie Blvd West ctreacy@soesyr.com F: 315-476-9094
60.95%, 62.95% off website
Contact for discount amount

Syracuse, NY 13202 www.soesyr.com   
WBMason Danielle Mietz P: 315-283-0049  

1200 State Fair Blvd danielle.mietz@wbmason.com  
Syracuse, NY 13209 www.wbmason.com   

mailto:Lisa@hummelsop.com
http://www.hummelsop.com/
mailto:orderdept@lakeshorelearning.com
mailto:orderdept@lakeshorelearning.com
http://www.lakeshorelearning.com/
mailto:orders@schoolspecialty.com
http://www.schoolspecialty.com/
mailto:ctreacy@soesyr.com
http://www.soesyr.com/
mailto:danielle.mietz@wbmason.com
http://www.wbmason.com/


Discounts Offered for Items NOT on Bid

Vendor Discount % Applies to:
Lakeshore Learning 7.5% School Furniture – Lakeshore Learning

School Specialty 14% School Furniture – Best Rite
School Specialty 14% School Furniture – Classroom Select
School Specialty 14% School Furniture – School Specialty
School Specialty 14% School Furniture – Royal

Syracuse Office Furniture 62.95% School Furniture – Hon
Syracuse Office Furniture 60.95% School Furniture – Best-Rite
Syracuse Office Furniture 62.95% School Furniture – Sandusky

School Specialty 14% Seating – Classroom Select
School Specialty 14% Seating - Lorell
School Specialty 14% Seating – National Public Seating
School Specialty 14% Filing / Storage – Bird-In-Hand
School Specialty 14% Filing / Storage – Safco
School Specialty 14% Library Furniture – Childcraft
School Specialty 14% Stage Music Furniture – Oklahoma Sound



DCMO BOCES Furniture Bid 2023-109
QTY DESCRIPTION BOCES # VENDOR # BID PRICE

$ ALTERNATIVE Awarded
Vendor

 Office Furniture      
EACH Swivel Office Desk Chair with Armrests, Mesh,

Mid-Back, Adjustable, black
203118 SST25910 $81.58 SuperSeats W.B. Mason

EACH Flash Furniture Mid-Back Quilted Vinyl Swivel Task
Chair with Nylon Arms, Multiple Colors

525007 FLFGO16911BKA $112.76 Flash Furniture W.B. Mason

EACH Basics High-Back Executive Swivel Office Computer
Desk Chair - Black with Pewter Finish, BIFMA Certified

K116 FLFGO2286HBKGG $179.61 Flash Furniture W.B. Mason

 School Furniture      
EACH 3' X 4' Quartet Prestige 2 Total Erase Magnetic

Whiteboards, Silver Aluminum Frame - #TEM544A
26375 QRTTEM544A $320.73

 

W.B. Mason

EACH Classroom Select Apollo Markerboard Activity Table,
Square, T-Mold, 36 x 36 Inches Order edge and legs in
marine blue. Order Height 25-30 inches.

2023461 HESQ36E.N.FMQ1.K
HEB4LEG.T1

$237.43

 

Syracuse Office
Environments

 Misc Furniture      
EACH Scholar Craft™ Ovation Series 4-Leg Chair, 16" H, Red

Shell, Chrome Frame
2023717 SCFQSWM3116COR

D
$48.20

 

W.B. Mason

EACH Scholar Craft™ HPL Activity Table, 24"D X 48"W
Rectangle Top, Height Adjustable, Grey Nebula

2023715 SCF949RE2448GNBK
2140CAC

$144.40

 

W.B. Mason

EACH Scholar Craft™ HPL Activity Table, 36"D X 72"W
Rectangle Top, Height Adjustable, Grey Nebula

2023716 SCF949RE3672GNBK
2145

$243.81

 

W.B. Mason

 SCHOOL FURNITURE BRANDS      

 Artco-Bell      
EACH 24 X 48" Artco-Bell Two Student Desk, Double Book

Box, Adjustable Height, Laminate Top - 1911
657614 HLDV-MRECT2026A.

E.CC.P8T
HLDA-15.T1
HLDA-15.T1

$308.49

 

Syracuse Office
Environments

 Best-Rite      
EACH 3' X 4' Marker Dry Erase Board W/ Aluminum Trim -

2H1NC
674526 LORELL 52512 $129.00 LORELL 52512 HUMMELS OFFICE PLUS



EACH 4' X 6' Best-Rite Euro Reversible Board, Steel Frame,
Dura-Rite Marker Board - 667RG-HH

663297 HMVMB-3672WW.C
.P8T

$695.87

 

Syracuse Office
Environments

 Classroom Select      
EACH Classroom Select Bond Tilt-N-Nest Adjustable Desk

with Foot Pedal, Markerboard Top, LockEdge
2023721 RUY20E $469.00 RUY20E HUMMELS OFFICE PLUS

EACH 48" X 24" Trapezoid Activity Table, Adj Legs, Black Edge
- Specify Top Laminate Color, T-Mold - Product Height -
20 - 30" - Classroom Select

1496753 FLFXUA2448TRAPGY
HA

$164.10 Flash Furniture W.B. Mason

EACH 60 X 66 Horseshoe Table, Adj Legs, Black Edge - Specify
Top Laminate Color

1496682 SCF949HS6066GNB
K2140

$404.46 ScholarCraft W.B. Mason

EACH 60" Classroom Select NeoShape Markerboard Activity
Table, Ovoid, 60 x 60", T-Mold Edge, NeoClass Leg,
Black Edge, 22-30" Adj Leg

1598191 HESQ48E.N.FMQ1.P
HEB4LEG.P

$296.39

 

Syracuse Office
Environments

EACH Classroom Select Markerboard Activity Table,
LockEdge, Half-Round, Adjustable Height Standard Leg

2023722 HESH3060E.N.FMQ1
.P
HEB4LEG.P

$324.90

 

Syracuse Office
Environments

EACH Flower Activity Table, Adjustable Height, 60 in,
Adjustable Legs - Classroom Select

1334866

 $0.00  
NO BID

EACH 24 x 48" LockEdge Adjustable Activity Table - Classroom
Select 1362566

1362566

 $0.00  
NO BID

EACH 48 X 72 Inch Kidney Shaped Activity Table, Adjustable
Legs, Classroom Select, Red, 168282

1362834

 $0.00  
NO BID

 ECR4Kids      
EACH Home Furnishing Plaza Wooden Kids' Toy Storage

Organizer with 16 Plastic Bins,X-Large, Natural/White
Simple Market Basket Storage Stand Organizer

2023464

 $0.00  

NO BID

EACH ECR4KIDS Small Bendi Bins with Handles -
ELR-20516-AS

56373 20516-AS $65.00

 

HUMMELS OFFICE PLUS

EACH ECR4KIDS Medium Bendi Bins with handles -
ELR-20517-AS

56374 ELR-20517-AS $22.50

 

W.B. Mason

 Hon      
EACH ECR4kids Large Bendi Bin with handle - ELR- 20518-AS 56372 ELR-20518-AS $28.13  W.B. Mason

 Lakeshore Learning      



EACH HON 310 26-1/2"D Vertical 4-Drawer Legal-Size File
Cabinet, Metal, Black

203322 H314.P.P $332.34

 

Syracuse Office
Environments

 Miscellaneous      
SET Flex-Space Book Bins - Set of 12 9131 TT836 $110.08

 

Lakeshore Learning
Materials (Quote #:
89937)

EACH Teardrop Beanbag Chair Black 2023726 DG-BEAN-SMALL $235.00

 

HUMMELS OFFICE PLUS

EACH Flash Furniture Cotton twill bean bag chair 2023724 DG-BEAN-LARGE $255.00

 

HUMMELS OFFICE PLUS

EACH 37" Stand Up Desk Riser Standing Desk Converter 525013 LORELL 99553 $259.00 LORELL 99553 HUMMELS OFFICE PLUS

EACH SDADI Adjustable height standing desk with swinging
footrest optional for standing and seating 3 modes

2023465 SAFCO 1201 $411.00 SAFCO 1201 HUMMELS OFFICE PLUS

EACH Hippo & Frog Standing Desk Height Adjustable Standing
Desk Converter Sit to Stand Desk Riser

K2206 VCTDCX610 $101.61 Victor W.B. Mason

EACH 27-Slot Mail And Supplies Center With 6 Cubbies And
Baskets - 165743

165743 SAF9423MO $136.50 Safco W.B. Mason

EACH ComHoma Office Computer Desk Chair Executive High
Back Chair Comfortable Ergonomic Managerial Chair
Adjustable PU Leather Home Office Desk Chair Swivel
Black

2023723 SST25920 $191.40 SuperSeats W.B. Mason

EACH Ballard Adjustable-Height Drafting Stool w/ Chrome
Foot Ring

2023719 AAPCS616 $218.69 Alera W.B. Mason

EACH Giantex Drafting Chair High Back Office Chairs with
Footrest Ring Flip-Up Armrest Height Adjustable
Executive Desk Chair Ergonomic Mesh Computer Task
Chair Lumbar Support Tall Office Chair (1)

2023725 FLFBLX5MDBKLEA $231.75 Flash Furniture W.B. Mason

 Royal      
EACH Burlston Luxura Faux Leather Manager Chair Black

(24810)
2023720 HVL151.SB11 $194.51

 

Syracuse Office
Environments

 Staples      
EACH Lorell Wire Deck Shelving, Boltless, 2300 Pound

Capacity, 36 x 18 x 72 Inches, Black
203323 ALESW853614SR $144.29 Alera W.B. Mason

 Virco      



EACH 60" X 22" Deep Cut Horseshoe Activity Table with
Heavy Duty Laminate Top - Vicro 48HORSE60DC

525020 SCF949HS6066GNB
K2140

$404.46 ScholarCraft W.B. Mason

EACH 60 X 66" Horseshoe Activity Table with Thermal Fused
Laminate Top, Flash Furniture

49983 XU-A6066-HRSE-GY-
T-A-GG

$318.56

 

W.B. Mason

 SEATING FURNITURE BRANDS      

 Classroom Select      
EACH 24 x 60 Science Table, Chem Guard, Oak, Leg Brace -

P7602K30L
34274 SLT1-2460C $434.99 National Public Seating W.B. Mason

EACH Sit'N'Gym Therapy Ball with Built in Legs, 17" - 1539113 1539113 CSIBL42 $22.06 Champion Sports W.B. Mason

EACH Sit'N'Gym Therapy Ball with Built in Legs, 22", Pearl
White - 1513467

1513467 CSIBL55 $22.39 Champion Sports W.B. Mason

EACH 20" Classroom Select NeoClass Elliptical Chair, A+ Seat
Height, Chrome Frame, Rubber Casters - Select Color
upon ordering - 1496373

1496373 SCFQSWM3118COB
K

$53.00 ScholarCraft W.B. Mason

EACH 12 in., NeoRok Stool - Specify Color When Ordering 1496631 KOR121 $59.50 Kore W.B. Mason

EACH 18-1/2" NeoRok Stool, Select Color Upon Ordering -
1546366

1546366 KOR598 $86.78 Kore W.B. Mason

EACH Classroom Select Pneumatic Task Chair, Specify Color 1442639 SCFQSWM310BK $139.11 ScholarCraft W.B. Mason

EACH Executive Task Chair, Mesh Seat, Mesh Back -
Classroom Select

1498096 FLFBLLB8801XDBKG
R

$302.76 Flash Furniture W.B. Mason

EACH Classroom Select Executive Mid-Back Work Chair, 27 x
26 x 40-3/4", Black

525019 HGTMM.Z1.H.H.M.C
U19.AL.SB.T

$158.93

 

Syracuse Office
Environments

EACH Rocking Reading Chair, Wood Frame, 33 X 18" 067414  $0.00  NO BID

 Hon      
EACH Big Joe XXL 7' Fuf Bean Bag Chair, Multiple

Colors/Fabrics, Actual Color: Lenox Cobalt - Model:
0001657 Walmart # 567217124

K1860

 $0.00  

NO BID

EACH Executive Swivel Mid-back Black Leather Chair, Basyx
VL171 - HON

1505176 BSXVL171SB11 $170.83

 

W.B. Mason

EACH Basyx VL616 Guest Chair, Black - 1102264 1102264 hvl616 $86.70

 

Syracuse Office
Environments

EACH HON Volt Fabric Office Task Chair, Armless, Navy -
690076 Model# H5701

49979 h5701 $137.07

 

Syracuse Office
Environments

 Kids Kore      
EACH Mesh Back Task Chair, Swivel, Tilt, Tension, HON Basyx-

HVL532
26340 hvl532 $241.94

 

Syracuse Office
Environments



EACH 12" Kore Wobble Chair - CR122 (Select Color Upon
Ordering)

49993 KOR121 $59.50

 

W.B. Mason

EACH 14" Kore Wobble Chair, Select Color Upon Ordering 49995 KOR113 $71.90  W.B. Mason

 Lakeshore Learning      

EACH 16" Kids Kore Wobble Chair, Select Color Upon
Ordering

36596 KOR612 $76.86

 

W.B. Mason

 Lorell      
EACH Easy-Clean Comfy Chairs - FF682BU 525015 FF682BU $322.83  Lakeshore Learning

EACH Lorell task chair, fabric seat and back - 1602571 1602571 LORELL 83306 $155.00 LORELL 83306 HUMMELS OFFICE PLUS

EACH Lorell V2 Gas-Lift Sit-To-Stand Desk Riser, Black -
607526

525009 LORELL 99553 $259.00 LORELL 99553 HUMMELS OFFICE PLUS

 Miscellaneous      
EACH Work Smart Black Eco Leather Executive Office Chair -

EC22070-EC3
525018 LORELL 60120 $279.00 LORELL 60120 HUMMELS OFFICE PLUS

EACH 45 cm Balance Ball Chair with Stay-Put Stability Legs,
Stay-N-Play, Includes Air Pump

50184 CSIBL42 $22.06 Champion Sports W.B. Mason

EACH Brenton Studio Mesh/Fabric Mid-Back Task Chair Black,
6785666

203328 SST25950 $153.11 SuperSeats W.B. Mason

EACH Round Bead Bag Chair 35"D Blue 2023728 FLFDGBEANLGDENI
M

$154.54 Flash Furniture W.B. Mason

EACH Chair, Mid-Back, Black Mesh, Swivel Ergonomic Task
Office w/Flip up Arms

43102 FLFBLX5MBKGG $163.88 Flash Furniture W.B. Mason

EACH Modway Explorer Mid-Back Mesh Office Chair With
Flip-Up Arms In Black

50185 FLFBLX5MBKGG $163.88 Flash Furniture W.B. Mason

 National Public Seating      
EACH OFIKA Home Office Chair, 2023727 SST25920 $191.40 SuperSeats W.B. Mason

 Royal Seating      
EACH Padded Stool, Adjustable Height 25 to 33", National

Public Seating - 1584454
1584454 6224H $63.06

 

W.B. Mason

 School Outfitters      
EACH 18" Stack Student Chair, Royal Seating 1100 Series,

Chrome Frame - Specify Color
1458246 SCFQSWM3118COB

K
$53.00 ScholarCraft W.B. Mason

 Staples      



EACH 60" X 24" Rectangle Activity Table w/ Adj Legs 52500 SCFFS849GBRE3060 $146.71 ScholarCraft W.B. Mason

EACH 18" Sit N Gym Ball Chair 903164 CSIBRT53WL $23.84 Champion Sports W.B. Mason

EACH Staples Black Mesh and Fabric Task Chair Item #:
2715724 | Model #: 51463-CC

525004 SST25910 $81.58 SuperSeats W.B. Mason

BOX Traymore Chair 2023468 SST25930 $119.85 SuperSeats W.B. Mason

EACH Hyken Technical Mesh Task Chair, with Adjustable Arms
& Lumbar Support - Red - 2257054

2257054 SST25950 $153.11 SuperSeats W.B. Mason

EACH Fayston Fabric Computer and Desk Chair, Charcoal
Model #: 51462 - 2719545

56371 SST25950 $153.11 SuperSeats W.B. Mason

EACH Mesh Back Fabric Task Chair, Black Model #: 51463-CC -
2719545

56370 SST25560 $159.20 SuperSeats W.B. Mason

EACH Staples Carder Mesh Office Chair, Black 24115-CC 525002 OFMESS3051 $168.00 OFM Inc W.B. Mason

EACH Tempur-Pedic 6400 Fabric Computer and Desk Chair,
Black - TP6400-BLK

525005 BSXVL220VA10 $253.49 Hon W.B. Mason

EACH Leather Executive Office Chair - 1241059 1241059 HVL151.SB11 $194.51

 

Syracuse Office
Environments

 STAGE/MUSIC FURNITURE      

 Oklahoma Sound      
EACH Staples Denaly Big & Tall Bonded Leather Manager

Chair, Black (51468)
2023467 HVL151.SB11 $194.51

 

Syracuse Office
Environments

EACH Portable Presentation Lectern, Model 70, Adjustable
height

1363826 1363826 $117.78

 

School Specialty

 Wenger      
EACH Full Floor Lectern, #222 - Oklahoma Sound 1363823 NPS222MY1 $250.26 National Public Seating W.B. Mason

EACH Instrument Storage Cabinets, Ultra-Stor - 15 Lockers w/
Grille Compartment Doors - Wenger

23350

 $0.00  
NO BID

 FILING/STORAGE FURNITURE BRANDS      

 Bird-In-Hand      
EACH 8 X 12' Geography World Map Carpet, Rectangle -

Childcraft
2003759

 $0.00  
NO BID

 Hon      

EACH 3 Shelf Deep Bookcase, 13 D X 36 H X 35-3/4 W, Wood 1464418 ALEVA634432WA $177.59  W.B. Mason



EACH HON 310 26-1/2"D Vertical 5-Drawer Letter-Size File
Cabinet, Metal, Light Gray Finish

203331 GLOBAL 26-501 $459.00 GLOBAL 26-501 HUMMELS OFFICE PLUS

 KC Bin      
EACH Mobile File Cabinet, Flagship Series 23" Deep, 3 Drawer

BBF - Hon H18723R
20972 H18723R.L.P $250.75

 

Syracuse Office
Environments

 Safco      
EACH 36 X 24 X 78" KC Bin Standard Metal Storage Cabinet 1386596 GLOBAL 9336S72L $399.00 GLOBAL 9336S72L

ALTERNATIVE OFFERED
36X18X72

HUMMELS OFFICE PLUS

EACH Safco Corrugated Literature Organizer, 12
Compartments, 29 x 12 x 12 Inches, Medium Oak

203332 9401MO $89.50

 

W.B. Mason

EACH Safco 24 Compartment Literature Organizer, Wood,
Adjustable Shelves - 7111MO

1362616B SAF9423MO $136.50

 

W.B. Mason

EACH Safco 36 Compartment Literature Organizer, Wood,
Adjustable Shelves, Medium Oak

1362617 SAF9424MO $165.50

 

W.B. Mason

 Sandusky Lee      
EACH Steel, Freestanding Storage Cabinet with Adjustable

Shelves, 72 in. H x 36 in. W x 18 in. D, Burgundy
23440 GLOBAL 9336S72L $399.00 GLOBAL 9336S72L HUMMELS OFFICE PLUS

EACH Sandusky Lee Snap Together 2 Shelf Bookcase, 34-1/2 x
13 x 30"

1363916 HS30ABC.L $130.05

 

Syracuse Office
Environments

EACH 4-Drawer Vertical File Cabinet, Locking w/ Key, Letter,
Putty/Beige, 22"D - 22336D

43D-33 525011
$0.00  

NO BID

EACH 36 X 18 X 72 Bookcases, 4 Shelf - BA40 361872-00 20967 HS60ABC.L $231.93
 

Syracuse Office
Environments

EACH Storex Interlocking Book Bin, Large, 14-1/4 x 5-1/4 x 7
Inches, Assorted, Set of 10

9132 STX 70105U06C $29.00 STX 70105U06C HUMMELS OFFICE PLUS

EACH 18" Mobile File Cabinet, Black 1496460 LORELL 00060 $159.00 LORELL 00060 HUMMELS OFFICE PLUS

EACH 36 X 16 X 40 Wood Bookshelf, 3 Shelf 1464175 LORELL 60071 $239.00 LORELL 60071 HUMMELS OFFICE PLUS

 Staples      
EACH 36" X 72" H X 18" D Tennsco Wardrobe/Storage

Cabinet, Putty 7214
56359 1471 $264.53 National Public Seating W.B. Mason

EACH 4-Drawer Vertical File Cabinet, Locking w/ Key, Letter,
Putty/Beige, 22"D - 22336D

525011 H514.P.L $288.62

 

Syracuse Office
Environments

 Furniture - Cafeteria      



 Miscellaneous      
EACH Square Bar-Height Café Table (36" W x 36" L x 42" H) 2023729 NPSCT33636XBGY1 $370.60 National Public Seating W.B. Mason

 LIBRARY FURNITURE      

 Childcraft      
EACH Metal Book Storage Rack, Red 201165 HLVBC5630.P $725.94

 
Syracuse Office
Environments


